
Total Price Total Price
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Unit

1 Carpet Cleaning Service 1 EA $17,220.00 $27,045.00
1.1 Sheriff Department 1 EA $700.00 $1,300.00
1.2 Sheriff Annex 1 EA $200.00 $380.00
1.3 Government Center 1 EA $3,000.00 $5,700.00
1.4 Courthouse 1 EA $6,100.00 $11,590.00
1.5 Road  Bridge 1 EA $330.00 $627.00
1.6 Boone County Annex 1 EA $300.00 $570.00
1.7 Alternative Sentencing 1 EA $280.00 $532.00
1.8 Juvenile Justice Center 1 EA $3,300.00 $627.00
1.9 605 E Walnut 1 EA $180.00 $342.00

1.10 609 E Walnut 1 EA $160.00 $304.00
1.11 Emergency Management 1 EA $1,500.00 $2,850.00
1.12 ECC Support Building 1 EA $1,170.00 $2,223.00

2 Sofa Cleaning 1 EA $45.00 $50.00
2.1 Sofa Cleaning 1 EA $40.00 $45.00
2.2 Sofa Chair / Office Chair 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
3 Price per Square Foot for "as needed" Individ  1 SF $0.20 $0.41

3.1 Regular Business Hours 1 SF $0.10 $0.19
3.2 Evening Hours 1 SF $0.10 $0.22
4 Renewal Pricing Increases 1 EA

4.1 First Renewal Period 1 EA No Bid 3.0%
4.2 Second Renewal Period 1 EA No Bid 3.0%
4.3 Third Renewal Period 1 EA No Bid 3.0%
4.4 Fourth Renewal Period 1 EA No Bid 3.0%
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